H.R.50

One Nundred Tenth Congress
of the
Mnited States of America

AT THE FIRST SESSION

Begun and held at the City of Washington on Thursday,
the fourth day of January, two thousand and seven

An Arct

To reauthorize the African Elephant Conservation Act and the Rhinoceros and
Tiger Conservation Act of 1994.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of
the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Multinational Species Conserva-
tion Funds Reauthorization Act of 2007”.

SEC. 2. REAUTHORIZATION AND AMENDMENT OF AFRICAN ELEPHANT
CONSERVATION ACT.

(a) NOTICE OF APPROVAL OF PROJECT PROPOSAL.—Section
2101(c) of the African Elephant Conservation Act (16 U.S.C. 4211(c))
is amended by striking “and to each country within which the
project is proposed to be conducted”.

(b) ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES.—Section 2306(b) of the African
Elephant Conservation Act (16 U.S.C. 4245(b)) is amended by
striking “$80,000” and inserting “$100,000”.

(c) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—Section 2306(a) of the
African Elephant Conservation Act (16 U.S.C. 4245(a)) is amended
by striking “2001, 2002, 2003, 2004, 2005, 2006, and 2007” and
inserting “2007 through 2012”.

SEC. 3. REAUTHORIZATION AND AMENDMENT OF RHINOCEROS AND
TIGER CONSERVATION ACT OF 1994.

(a) NOTICE OF APPROVAL OF PROJECT PROPOSAL.—Section 5(c)
of the Rhinoceros and Tiger Conservation Act of 1994 (16 U.S.C.
5304(c)) is amended in the third sentence by striking “, to the
Administrator, and to each country within which the project is
to be conducted” and inserting “and to the Administrator”.

(b) ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES.—Section 10(b) of the Rhinoceros
and Tiger Conservation Act of 1994 (16 U.S.C. 5306(b)) is amended
by striking “$80,000” and inserting “$100,000”.

(¢c) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—Section 10(a) of the
Rhinoceros and Tiger Conservation Act of 1994 (16 U.S.C. 5306(a))



H.R.50—2

is amended by striking “2001, 2002, 2003, 2004, 2005, 2006, and
2007” and inserting “2007 through 2012”.

Speaker of the House of Representatives.

Vice President of the United States and
President of the Senate.



